
 

 

 

 
 
November 7, 2017 
Patricia L. Rambosk, MMC, City Clerk 
239-213-1015 
 
AIRPORT AUTHORITY (2 vacancies) An autonomous 
body appointed by the City Council to oversee operation 
of the Naples Airport.  Members of the Airport Authority 
must be domiciled in the city limits.  Terms 4 years.  
Meets 3rd Thurs. at 8:30 a.m.  Average meeting time: 3 
hours per month.   

Community Redevelopment Agency Advisory Board (4 
vacancies for legal residents of the City who are 
business owners or property owners in the “D” 
Downtown District {generally the area bounded by 8th 
Street South to Goodlette-Frank Road and 7th Avenue 
North to 5th Avenue South}, or the Community 
Redevelopment Area {generally the area bounded by 
7th Avenue North, 6th Avenue South to the Gordon 
River and 3rd Street}, or the 5th Avenue South Special 
Overlay District. 7-member board which advises the 
Community Redevelopment Area by providing public 
input and technical advice on land use, economic and 
other issues within the City’s redevelopment district, 
and reviews certain petitions within the district.  Terms: 
2 years.  Meets 4th Monday at 9:00 a.m.  Average 
meeting time: 1 hour per month. 
 
EAST NAPLES BAY CITIZENS ADVISORY COMMITTEE (3 
vacancies for residents within the East Naples Bay 
District boundaries. Members must live in Oyster Bay, 
Golden Shores or Royal Harbor.)  This committee is 
charged with the responsibility of making 
recommendations to the City Council on a variety of 
issues within this canal maintenance district such as 
maintenance dredging, canal cleanup, and maintenance 
of private aids to navigation. Terms: 3 years.  Monthly as 
called.  Average meeting time: 1 hour per month. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

PUBLIC ART ADVISORY COMMITTEE (1 alternate 
member vacancy) 5-member board with one alternate 
that deals with public artwork in the City, including 
placement, donation and loan of public artwork.  Terms: 
4 years.  Meets 4th Tuesday at 2:00 p.m.  Average 
meeting time: 1 hour per month.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Unless otherwise specified, all members of boards and 
committees must meet city residency requirements and 
are subject to state and local ethics laws; some are also 
subject to State of Florida financial disclosure 
requirements.  To apply for any of these vacancies, visit 
the City’s website at www.naplesgov.com under the 
City Clerk’s webpage (Boards & Committees).  For 
further information, please contact the City Clerk's 
Office at 239-213-1015. 
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